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Ganja feiert mit großem Konzert das
Erbe von Volkskünstler Bulbul!

Ganja ehrte den berühmten Opernsänger Bulbul mit einem
Konzert, das klassische azerbaijani Musik feierte und junge

Talente förderte.

Ganja, Aserbaidschan - In a dazzling celebration of musical
heritage, Ganja city has rolled out the red carpet for a
spectacular concert honoring the legendary opera singer Bulbul,
a true titan of Azerbaijani culture. This event, part of the
ambitious „Cultural Wealth of the People“ project, showcases
the rich tapestry of national musical theater and vocal artistry,
paying tribute to Bulbul’s monumental contributions to the arts.

The concert, organized by the Ganja State Philharmonic Hall,
featured an impressive lineup of performers, including the
esteemed People’s Artist Sevinc Ibrahimova and Honored
Culture Worker Mehpara Jafarova. Audiences were treated to a
mesmerizing array of performances, with beloved romances by
Uzeyir Hajibayli like „Sevgili canan“ and „Sənsiz,“ alongside
stirring pieces from Asaf Zeynalli, Fikrat Amirov, and Muslim
Magomayev. The evening resonated with the powerful notes of
Aslan Shah’s aria from „Shah Ismail,“ captivating attendees and
celebrating the depth of Azerbaijani musical talent.

Celebrating Cultural Heritage

The „Cultural Wealth of the People“ initiative aims to elevate
classical Azerbaijani music, engaging modern youth and
broadening the reach of folk traditions. This concert is just one
of many events dedicated to honoring the giants of Azerbaijani



culture, following previous evenings that celebrated the works of
renowned composers like Fikret Amirov and Gara Garayev. With
media partners such as Azernews.Az and Trend.Az supporting
the event, the concert not only highlighted the artistic legacy of
Bulbul but also reinforced the importance of preserving and
promoting the nation’s cultural treasures.

Details
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